
 

Savor Italy’s Finest at La Piazza: A Feast for the Soul 

Manila, Philippines – La Piazza, Okada Manila’s signature Italian restaurant, offers diners to 
experience the heart of Italy through its expertly crafted menu. Led by Chef Mattia Stroppa, the 
restaurant celebrates Italian culinary traditions, featuring dishes inspired by generations of family 
recipes. As part of Okada Manila’s “Beyond Flavors, A Feast for the Soul” campaign, La Piazza 
delivers an unforgettable dining experience that brings people together through exceptional 
flavors and shared moments. 

La Dolce Vita in Every Bite 

La Piazza’s menu offers a tribute to Italy’s rich culinary heritage, featuring a selection of dishes 
designed for celebrations big and small. Guests can enjoy highlights such as Gamberone Aglio & 
Olio, pan-seared king prawn with a savory sauce and Sfincione bread; Marinara Pizza, topped 
with garlic, capers, oregano, black olives, and white anchovies; and Tagliatelle Ai Funghi, 

handcrafted pasta in a creamy butter sauce with king oyster mushrooms and local stracciatella 
cheese. 

The centerpiece of the menu, Carre Di Agnello, features perfectly grilled lamb, while dessert 
options like Pera, a velvety lemon mousse with pear compote and buttery crumble, provide the 

perfect ending to any meal. 

Each dish is complemented by an extensive wine list from La Piazza’s award-winning wine cellar, 
which earned the Wine Spectator’s Best of Award of Excellence for 2024.  

Dining in Style 

La Piazza offers two distinct settings to enhance any dining experience. The Trattoria provides a 
casual yet elegant ambiance, with high chairs and barrel tables set against a lively bar backdrop. 
For more intimate gatherings, the Ristorante features high Gothic ceilings, plush seating, and soft 
lighting, creating a sophisticated environment ideal for romantic evenings or family celebrations.  

A Global Culinary Journey 

La Piazza is one of over 40 dining options available at Okada Manila, showcasing flavors from 
around the world. Through the “Beyond Flavors, A Feast for the Soul” campaign, Okada Manila 
highlights the emotional and transformative power of food, taking guests on a journey through 
diverse culinary traditions. 

For more information about Okada Manila’s dining scene, visit 
https://www.okadamanila.com/beyond-flavors-a-feast-for-the-soul. For inquiries and 
reservations, email RestaurantReservation@okadamanila.com or call +632 8555 5799. 

 

About Okada Manila 



Okada Manila, a Forbes 5-star destination in the Philippines, seamlessly blends unmatched 
hospitality, gaming, and entertainment across 30 breathtaking hectares. Known for its unique 
service philosophy, Okada Manila combines the warmth of Filipino hospitality with the precision 
of Japanese excellence, ensuring every guest feels truly special. 

Guests can marvel at The Fountain, a world-renowned water choreography masterpiece, or enjoy 
the expansive gaming floor—the largest in the Philippines—featuring a wide array of table games 
and electronic gaming machines. Exclusive clubs like Perlas, Maharlika, and the VIP Club offer 
elite gaming experiences for discerning guests. 

For families, PLAY and Thrillscape provide exciting and engaging entertainment options designed 
to cater to both developmental and recreational needs. The Sole Retreat and the Forbes 5-star-
rated The Retreat Spa offer sanctuaries promoting wellness and relaxation. Culinary delights 
await at over 40 dining venues, and a variety of shopping options ensure convenience and a 
premium experience at your fingertips. 

Business travelers will find state-of-the-art facilities for meetings, incentives, conferences, and 
exhibitions (MICE), offering well-appointed spaces equipped with the latest technology. Cove 
Manila, a world-class indoor beach club, serves as an exclusive venue for private events and 
daycations, providing a stunning backdrop for special occasions under a UV-protected dome. The 
Okada Manila Entertainment Group (OMEG) brings world-class performances to life, enriching 
the vibrant entertainment landscape. 

Guests can stay in one of 1,001 accommodations, each designed for comfort and sophistication. 
Digital innovations, including the Okada Online Casino and the Okada Manila App, make it easier 
than ever to enjoy the offerings. 

Okada Manila is the ultimate destination for leisure and entertainment. Visit 
www.okadamanila.com to explore. 
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